Bid B18-15, FNS Smallwares Tabsheet

Manning Brothers

Norvell Fixture

Sam Tell & Son

Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty
Apron, Dishroom Protective - 6-8 Mil PVC Apron w grommets electronically $ 3.31 | $ 6.62 | $ 551 [$ 11.02 | No Bid No Bid
. - . N X LaCrosse
heat sealed and vinyl reinforced at bib and waist grommets; nylon ties to Rainfair 2
secure apron
Baskets - Rectangular Large Serving Baskets Tablecraft 1079 1 $ 13.79 | $ 13.79 | $ 17.56 | $ 17.56 | $ 13.79 | $ 13.79
Baskets - Oval Serving Baskets Tablecraft 1076 1 $ 8.62 | $ 8.62 | $ 11.49 | ¢ 1149 | $ 9.03 | % 9.03
Baskets, IRONWORKS 9” round American 1 $ 12.47 | $ 12.47 | $ 16.63 | $ 16.63 | $ 13.07 | $ 13.07
Metalcraft
Basket, Stand for 9” Round Ironworks baskets American 1 n/a N/A NB No Bid $ 61.38 | $ 61.38
Metalcraft
Baskets, IRONWORKS 20" Rectangler American 1 $ 15.59 | $ 15.59 | $ 28.35 | $ 28.35 (% 22.28 | $ 22.28
Metalcraf
Basket, Stand for 20” 2-Tiered Rectangler Ironworks baskets American $ 43.00 | $ 43.00 | $ 57.33 [ $ 57.33 | $ 45.05 | $ 45.05
(for 5 baskets on each tier) Metalcraft 1
1S12
Bowl - 8 gt. Stainless Steel Mixing Vollrath 47938 5 $ 6.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 8.25 | $ 41.25 | $ 6.48 | $ 32.42
Bowl - 13 gt. Stainless Steel Mixing Vollrath 47943 1 $ 7.84 | $ 7.84 | $ 10.77 | $ 10.77 | $ 8.46 | $ 8.46
Bowl - 16 gt. Stainless Steel Mixing Vollrath 47946 5 $ 894 | $ 44,70 | $ 12.29 ($136.50 $ 9.65 | $ 48.26
Bowl - 30 gt. Stainless Steel Mixing Vollrath 79300 1 $ 116.55 | $ 116.55 |$160.21 $ 160.21 | $ 125.88 | $ 125.88
Box Opener Dexter-Russell 8 $ 4.67 | $ 37.36 | $ 6.34 | $ 50.72 | $ 248 | $ 19.81
Broom: angled with aluminum handle and nylon bristles. Rubbermaid 100 $ 17.77 | $ 1,777.00 | $ 24.44 [ ¢ 2,444.00 | $ 19.21 | $ 1,920.60
6385
Brush - 2" Pastry Sparta 40401 6 $ 6.75 | $ 40.50 | $ 9.09 | $ 54.54 | $ 7.29 | $ 43.73
Brush - 3" Pastry with nylon bristles Sparta 40402 2 $ 7.88 | $ 55.16 | $ 10.60 | $ 74.20 | $ 8.50 | $ 59.52
Brush - Vegetable, 4"X 1 1/4" with hardwood block and tampico fiber bristles Sparta 40164 10 $ 7.10 | $ 71.00 | $ 9.56 | $ 95.60 | $ 7.67 | $ 76.73
Brush - 4"x27" Steam Kettle w/ 36” handle Sparta 1 $ 30.24 | $ 30.24 | $ 40.59 | $ 40.59 | $ 32.56 | $ 32.56
40040/40230
Brush - Bun Pan Lip Scrub Sparta 40024 1 $ 5.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 6.73 | $ 6.73 | $ 540 [ $ 5.40
Brush - Hand and Nail Kit Sparta 40021 37 $ 9.98 | $ 369.26 | $ 13.45 | $ 497.65 | $ 10.79 | $ 399.19
Brush - Pot Short Handles, nylon Sparta 40530 1 $ 347 | $ 347 | $ 6.23 | $ 6.23 | $ 10.84 | $ 10.84
Brush - Steam Kettle Valve Sparta 40150 1 $ 527 | $ 527 | $ 7.02 | % 7.02 | $ 563 % 5.63
Brush - Wire Grill Sparta 40672 1 $ 6.91 | $ 6.91 | $ 9.22 | % 9.22 | $ 739 | $ 7.39




Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty
Bucket Opener - Quick, one piece aluminum 4 &5 gallon opener, dishwasher | Tablecraft E-Z 4 $ 11.22 | $ 44.88 | $ 26.40 | $ 105.60 | $ 20.74 | $ 82.97
safe Pail Opener
Bun Pan Rack, 20 standard slides on 3" centers, medium to heavy duty, casters. Kelmax 3 $ 359.86 | $ 1,079.58 | $ 599.76 | $ 1,799.28 | $ 424.12 | $ 1,272.35
Holds sheet pans ONLY APR2018-3
Bun Pan Rack, 12 universal pan slides. Accommodate steam table pans AND bun Kelmax 3 $ 381.02 | $ 1,143.06 | $ 635.04 | $ 1,905.12 | $ 449.06 | $ 1,347.19
pans, medium to heavy duty, casters APRU1218-5
Cake Pans- 19 3/4” x 21 3" x 2 Ya" professional standard strength Wearever 4432 1 $ 57.47 | $ 57.47 | $ 87.60 | $ 87.60 | $ 57.11 | $ 57.11
Cake Pans 12x18x2 Wearever 4455 1 $ 33.46 | $ 33.46 | $ 4599 | $ 45.99 | $ 33.24 | $ 33.24
Can Opener, Blades Only for Electric Edlund #270 EDK270 12 $ 73.16 | $ 87792 | $ 136.50 | $ 1,638.00 | $ 76.64 | $ 919.68
Can Opener, Blades Only for manual Edlund #S-11 Edlund K032M 13 $ 49.88 | $ 648.44 | $ 93.00 | $ 1,209.00 | $ 48.21 | $ 626.73
Can Opener Cleaning tool for Edlund Edlund ST-93 1 $ 2490 | $ 24.90 | $ 33.92 | $ 33.92 | $ 25.25 | $ 25.25
Can Opener - Blades Only for Electric Edlund Single Speed Edlund KOO6SP 1 $ 2433 | $ 24.33 | $ 45.00 | $ 45.00 152,90 | $ 152.90
Can Opener - Gear Only for Electric Edlund Single Speed G0065SP 1 $ 24.33 | $ 24.33 | $ 45.00 | $ 45.00 | No Bid No Bid
Can Opener - Heavy Duty Single Speed Electric Edlund #203 > $ 615.68 | $ 1,231.36 | $ 838.57  $ 1,677.14 | $ 624.20 | $ 1,248.39
Can Opener - S/S Heavy Duty, Manually Operated Edlund S11 > $ 404.27 | $ 808.54 | $ 550.62  $ 1,101.24 | $ 409.86 | $ 819.72
Carts, Utility - 500 Ib. Capacity, S/S, Ergo One System Lakeside 6810 3 $ 367.61| $ 1,102.83 | $ 490.14 | $ 1,470.42 | $ 385.11 | $ 1,155.33
Cart, Utility - Heavy duty, sturdy yet lightweight foam construction with Rubbermaid $ 173.84 | $ 347.68 | $ 238.88 | $ 477.76 | $ 187.69 | $ 375.39
rounded corners, two shelves on casters; 200 Ib per shelf; 30”1 x 16” w 4500 2
Cart Utility - Heavy duty, sturdy yet lightweight foam construction with Rubbermaid 5 $ 197.48 | $ 394.96 | $ 271.35| % 542.70 | $ 213.20 | $ 426.40
rounded corners, two shelves on casters; 133 Ib. per shelf; 36” | x 24" w 4520
Colander - 16 gqt. Extra heavy duty aluminum Wearever 4616 1 $ 79.38 | $ 79.38 | $ 109.12 | $ 109.12 | $ 85.73 | $ 85.73
Chilling Utensil, Rapi-Kool - HACCP tool to be filled with water and frozen and KatchAll 1 $ 30.04 | $ 30.04 | $ 40.05 | ¢ 40.05 | $ 3147 | $ 31.47
used to rapidly chill soups, stews, sauces; NSF certified #RCU-128
INSULATED FOOD CONTAINER COLDMASTER COLDCROCK ( for CARLISLE CM 20 $ 3243 | $ 648.60 | $ 43.65 | $ 873.00 | $ 34.30 | $ 685.97
CONDIMENTS) 103002
INSULATED FOOD CONTAINER COLDMASTER COLDCROCK PUMP KIT $ 4.79 | $ 239.50 | $ 6.44 | $ 322.00 | $ 5.06 | $ 252.95
CM 103502 50

(NO LID)
INSULATED FOOD CONTAINER COLDMASTER COLDCROCK PUMP LID CM 1033P07 50 $ S | 8 194.00 | $ 522 1% 261.00 | ¢ 410 | $ 205.18
Cold Food Pan - clear poly for use on Salad Bars with temperature range of $ - $ - No Bid No Bid
40 degrees F to 212 degrees F
Cold Food Pan - 12" x 20" x 2 1/2 full size Cambro 12CW 1 $ 8.57 | $ 8.57 | $ 11.43 | $ 11.43 | $ 8.98 [ % 8.98
Cold Food Pan - 12" x 20" x 4" full size Cambro 14CW 1 $ 10.90 | $ 10.90 | $ 1454 | $ 14.54 | $ 11.42 [ ¢ 11.42
Cold Food Pan - 12” x 20" x 6" full size Cambro 16CW 1 $ 13.23 [ $ 13.23 | $ 17.64 | $ 17.64 | $ 13.86 | $ 13.86




Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty
Cold Food Pan - 20” x 6” x 2 1/2" half long Cambro 22LPCW 1 $ 6.51 [ $ 6.51 | $ 8.68 | $ 8.68 | $ 6.82 [ $ 6.82
Cold Food Pan - 20” x 6” x 4” half long Cambro 24LPHP 1 $ 22.77 | $ 22.77 | $ 10.82 | $ 10.82 | $ 23.86 | $ 23.86
Cold Food Pan - 12" x 10" x 2 1/2" half size Cambro 22CW 1 $ 4.76 | $ 4.76 | $ 6.35 | $ 6.35 | $ 499 | $ 4.99
Cold Food Pan - 12" x 10" x 4" half size Cambro 24CW 1 $ 592 | $ 5.92 | $ 7.90 | $ 7.90 | $ 6.21 [ $ 6.21
Cold Food Pan - 12" x 6" x 2 1/2" one-third size Cambro 32CW 1 $ 3.57 | $ 3.57 | $ 4.77 | $ 4.77 | $ 3.74 | $ 3.74
Cold Food Pan - 12” x 6” x 4” one-third size Cambro 34CW 1 $ 492 | $ 492 | $ 6.56 | $ 6.56 | $ 515 | ¢ 5.15
Cold Food Pan - 10" x 6" x 2 1/2" one-fourth size Cambro 42CW 1 $ 3.61 | $ 3.61 (% 482 | $ 482 |$ 3.79 | $ 3.79
Cold Food Pan - 10” x 6” x 4” one-fourth size Cambro 44CW 1 $ 4.26 | $ 4.26 | $ 5.68 | $ 5.68 | $ 4.46 | $ 4.46
Cold Food Pan - 4" one-third size Cambro 64CW 1 $ 297 | $ 297 | $ 3.96 | $ 3.96 | $ 3.11 | $ 3.11
Cold Food Pan - 4" one-sixth size Cambro 1 N/A N/A $ 286 | $ 2.86 | $ 515 | ¢ 5.15
Cold Food Pan Cover one-sixth size Cambro 60CWC 1 $ 197 | $ 1.97 | $ 262 | % 2.62 | $ 2.06 | $ 2.06
Cold Food Pan Cover one-fourth size Cambro 40CWC 1 $ 251 | 3 251 $ 335 | $ 3.35 [ $ 263 | $ 2.63
Cold Food Pan - Cover - full size w/notch Cambro 1 $ 7.23 | $ 7.23 | $ 9.64 | $ 9.64 | $ 7.57 | $ 7.57
10CWCHN
Cold Food Pan - Cover - half size long w/notch Cambro 1 $ 554 | $ 5.54 | $ 7.39 | $ 739 | $ 581 | $ 5.81
20LPCWC
Cold Food Pan - Cover - half size w/notch Cambro 1 $ 442 | $ 442 | $ 589 | $ 5.89 | $ 463 | $ 4.63
20CWCHN
Cold Food Pan - Cover - one-third size w/notch Cambro 1 $ 3.78 | $ 3.78 | $ 503 |% 5.03 % 3.96 | $ 3.96
30CWCHN
Cold Food Pan - Cover - one-fourth size w/notch Cambro 1 $ 2.51 | $ 251 [ $ 335 | % 3.35 ([ $ 263 |3 2.63
40CWCHN
Cold Food Pan - Drain Shelves, Full Size Cambro 10CWD 1 $ 6.23 | $ 6.23 | $ 8.30 | $ 8.30 [ $ 6.52 | $ 6.52
Cook Forks, 14" Dexter 5205 1 $ 28.18 | $ 28.18 | $ 18.27 | $ 18.27 | $ 29.53 | $ 29.53
Cutter - Multi-Wheel Dough/Cake 5 wheel, adjustable, 4 3/4 " diameter, A 1395 1 $ 1193 | $ 1193 | $ 26.00 | $ 26.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 35.00
stainless steel blades teco
Cutting Board Set - Combo pack containing 6 differing colored boards each KatchAll #CB- 3 $ 148.13 | $ 44439 | $ 197.50 | $ 592.50 | $ 155.18 | $ 465.54
18"x 24" x 2", NSF approved 1824-KC
Cutting Board Mat, 16” x 22", NSF approved KatchAll #CBM 1 $ 23.39 | $ 23.39 | $ 31.18 | $ 31.18 | $ 24.50 | $ 24.50
1622
Cutting Board Storage Stand - Heavy duty, Stainless Steel KatchAll KLR-ST 3 $ 35.74 | $ 107.22 | $ 47.65 | $ 14295 | $ 3744 | $ 112.33
Dish Machine Curtains SHORT Hobart 1 $ 67.73 | $ 67.73 | $ 282.21 | $ 282.21 | No Bid No Bid
CLPS66E
Dish Machine Curtains SHORT Hobart Model 1 $ 63.90 | $ 63.90 | NB No Bid No Bid No Bid
#CRS66A




Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty
Dish Machine Curtains LONG Hobart 1 $ 91.54 | $ 91.54 | $ 38143 | $ 381.43 | No Bid No Bid
CLPS66E
Dish Machine Curtains LONG Hobart Model 1 $ 93.16 | $ 93.16 | NB No Bid No Bid No Bid
#CRS66A
Dish machine ROD only for Hobart CRS66A short Hobart 120266-1 1 $ 16.46 | $ 16.46 | $ 68.57 | $ 68.57 | No Bid No Bid
Dish machine ROD only for Hobar CRS66A long Hobart 12066-1 1 $ 16.46 | $ 16.46 | NB No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dish Machine Curtains SHORT for Hobart CLPS66e Hobart #919509 1 $ 31.48 | $ 3148 | $ 131.18 | $ 131.18 | No Bid No Bid
Dish Machine ROD only for Hobart CCLPS66e short curtain Hobart #919507 1 $ 16.67 | $ 16.67 | $ 69.48 | ¢ 69.48 | No Bid No Bid
Dish Machine Curtains Exit MODEL Insinger-Admiral| Part # D3-528 1 $ 185.12  $ 185.12 | $ 336.59 | $ 336.59 | No Bid No Bid
66-4
Dish Machine Curtains ENTER MODEL Insinger-Admiral | Part # D3-525 1 $ 192.48 | $ 192.48 | $ 350.03 | $ 350.03 | No Bid No Bid
66-4
Dish Machine Curtains CENTER MODEL Insinger-Admiral | Part # D3-508 1 $ 105.02 | $ 105.02 | $ 190.99 | $ 190.99 | No Bid No Bid
66-4
Dish Machine Curtains MODEL Insinger-Admiral 66-| Part # D3-527 1 $ 192.48 | $ 192.48 | $ 350.03 | $ 350.03 | No Bid No Bid
4
Dish Machine Curtains MODEL Insinger-Admiral 66- Part # D3-550 1 $ 87.53 | $ 87.53 | $ 159.17 | $ 159.17 | No Bid No Bid
4
Dispenser, Squeeze Bottle - w/ cap, 24 oz, Clear Polyethylene Tablecraft 124C 20 10.29/dz $ 205.80 | $ 133 | $ 26.60 | $ 1.08 | $ 21.60
Dispenser, Squeeze Bottle - w/ cap, 24 oz, Red plastic for ketchup Tablecraft 124K 20 11.61/dz $ 232.20 | $ 133 | $ 26.60 | $ 1.22 | $ 24.40
Dispensing Pump Kit - 1 oz Plastic, (1 pump w/ 5 lid sizes) Tablecraft 20 $ 7.86 | $ 157.20 | $ 1048 | $ 209.60 | $ 8.23 [ $ 164.69
#662K

Dispensing Set - Salad Dressing, clear Lexan to include 6 - (48 oz) Tabl ft 484 3 $ 79.30 | $ 237.90 | $ 105.74 | $ 317.22 | $ 83.08 | $ 249.23
dispensers with attenuators, 1 clear 12" x 20" insert holder, 9 1.D. collars, ablecra
First Aid Kit for 25 37 $ 44.77 | $ 1,656.49 | $ 55.00 | $ 2,035.00 | $ 2097 | $ 775.74
Flatware - Dinner Forks Medium Weight, Windsor Windsor DOZEN 1 $ 245 | $ 2.45 | $ 3.99 | $ 3.99 | $ 1.80 | $ 1.80
Flatware - Dinner Knives Medium Weight, Windsor — Per Dozen Windsor DOZEN 1 $ 538 | $ 5.38 | $ 599 | $ 5.99 | $ 3.37 | $ 3.37
Flatware - Teaspoons Medium Weight, Windsor Windsor DOZEN 1 $ 1.48 | $ 1.48 | $ 299 | $ 299 [ $ 1.28 | $ 1.28
Flatware Cylinders: perforated white poly Vollrath 52643 20 $ 1.79 | $ 35.80 | $ 5.46 | $ 109.20 | $ 193 | $ 38.61
Floor Brush BLUE 10" dual surface scrub brush w/rubber squeegee, w/handle 3619014 Flo Pac > $ 20.90 | $ 41.80 | $ 28.13 | $ 56.26 | $ 15.25 | $ 30.50
Food Sectionizer, Apple Corer and Plunger ONLY, S/S 5-34 1 $ 67.20 | $ 67.20 | $ 89.60 | $ 89.60 | $ 70.40 | $ 70.40
Food Sectionizer Blades ONLY, 6 cut Sunkist S-3 1 $ 2835 | $ 28.35 | $ 37.80 | $ 37.80 | $ 53.90 | $ 53.90
Food Sectionizer Blades ONLY, 8 cut Sunkist S-29 1 $ 3045 | $ 30.45 | $ 40.60 | $ 40.60 | $ 3190 | $ 31.90




Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty
Food Sectionizer with 2 blades (1-6 wedge , 1-8 wedge) Sunkist > $ 218.40 | $ 436.80 | $ 313.60 | $ 627.20 | $ 280.72 | $ 561.44
Food Sectionizer, 6 SLICER BLADE (must order plunger below with this . $ 38.85 | $ 38.85 | $ 51.80 | $ 51.80 | $ 40.70 | $ 40.70
blade) for tomatoes Sunkist S-4 1
Food Sectionizer, #10 PLUNGER for 6 Slicer Blade Sunkist S-10 1 $ 1575 | $ 15.75 | $ 21.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 16.50 | $ 16.50
Funnel - 6” Diameter, Stainless Steel Volirath 84760 1 $ 2475 | $ 24.75 | $ 75.60 | $ 75.60 | $ 26.73 | $ 26.73
Glove, Cutting - Super tough stainless steel and cut resistant nylon cord $ 12.05 | $ 60.25 | $ 17.85 | $ 89.25 | $ 11.99 | $ 59.96
. . ) . Forchner 83503 5
made for cutting and slicer cleanina. Medium
Hand Truck 500 Ib. capacity Lockwood 1 $ 88.83 | $ 88.83 | $ 336.00 | $ 336.00 | $ 270.60 | $ 270.60
Hood Filter Lifting Tool Baffle Boss 1 $ 57.50 | $ 57.50 | $ 76.66 | $ 76.66 | No Bid No Bid
FR1291090
Hose, Heavy duty 50 ft. rubber water hose to withstand water temperatures Teknor Apex $ 48.30 | $ 96.60 | $ 50.89 | $ 101.78 | $ 33.19 | $ 66.39
of up to 180 degrees, Insulated nozzle included. 724311 and 2
725369
Hose, Hot water Nozzle Only for hose #724311 Teknor Apex 5 $ 16.62 | $ 83.10 | $ 8.64 | $ 43.20 | $ 17.41 | $ 87.05
725369
Ingredient Bin, Trimeld construction, w/ 3” casters, sliding hinged lid Rubbermaid 1 $ 289.54 | $ 289.54 | $ 386.05| $ 386.05 | $ 303.33( $ 303.33
3602
Kettle Ball Whip, Stainless Steel, 48" Hodges S2300 1 $ 120.76 | $ 120.76 | $ 161.01 | $ 161.01 | No Bid No Bid
Kettle Mixing Paddle, Stainless Steel 48" Admiral Kraft 1 $ 15.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 42.11 | ¢ 42.11 | $ 14.56 | $ 14.56
PA48
Kitchen Shears - forged steel 8" long Tablecraft 3 $ 235 | % 7.05 % 6.27 | $ 18.81 | $ 2.09 | $ 6.28
EGU7
Knife Sharpener, Electric Edlund 395 1 $ 371.07 | $ 371.07 | $ 505.40 | $ 505.40 | $ 376.20 | $ 376.20
Knives - Boning: 5" narrow blade Russell/ $ 11.27 | $ 56.35 | $ 15.03 | ¢ 75.15 | $ 11.81 | $ 59.03
Harrington 5
S135F
Knives - Bread/ Meat Slicing: scalloped edge blade Russell/ $ 11.55 | $ 57.75 | $ 1540 | $ 77.00 | $ 12.10 | $ 60.51
Harrington 5
S162-8SC
Knives - Butcher: 8” standard blade Russell/ $ 17.41 | $ 87.05 | $ 23.22 | $ 116.10 | $ 18.24 | $ 91.20
Harrington S- 5
112-8
Knives - Cook's: 10” blade Russell/ $ 21.64 | $ 108.20 | $ 28.85 | $ 144.25 | $ 22.67 | $ 113.36
Harrington S145; 5
10
Knives - Lettuce, Plastic Progressive 15 $ 1.30 | $ 19.50 | $ 5.00 | $ 75.00 | No Bid No Bid
GT3608
Knives - Paring: 3” blade Russell/ $ 395 | % 19.75 | $ 526 | $ 26.30 | $ 8.17 | $ 40.84
Harrington S- 5
104
Knives - Rocker for cutting whole round pizza Wearever 68720 4 $ 43.63 | $ 174.52 | $ 59.98 | $ 239.92 [ $ 47.12 | $ 188.50




Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty
Knives, Utility: See Boning 9” blade Dexter S1429 1 $ 13.82 | $ 13.82 | $ 18.43 | $ 18.43 | $ 14.48 | $ 14.48
Knives - Utility: See Boning, 6” blade Russell/ $ 1191 | $ 1191 | $ 15.88 | $ 15.88 | $ 13.49 | $ 13.49
Harrington S- 1
136
Ladder - 3-step heavy duty with side hand rails. AMOCo or $ 22245 | $ 222.45 | $ 363.83 | % 363.83 | $ 257.28 | $ 257.28
Kelmax RSL-3 !
Ladles - One piece stainless steel, 2 oz. Volirath 46902 1 $ 2.02 | $ 2.02 | $ 6.16 | $ 6.16 | $ 2.18 | $ 2.18
Ladles - One piece stainless steel, 4 oz. Volirath 46904 1 $ 2.38 | $ 2.38 | $ 7.28 | $ 7.28 | $ 257 | $ 2.57
Ladles - One piece stainless steel, 6 oz. Vollrath 46906 1 $ 252 | % 2.52 | $ 7.70 | $ 7.70 | $ 2.72 | $ 2.72
Ladles - One piece stainless steel, 8 oz. Vollrath 46908 1 $ 2.70 | $ 2.70 | $ 8.26 | $ 8.26 | $ 292 | 3% 2.92
Mat - Anti-fatigue, Grease Resistant, Non-Absorbent closed cell nitrile rubber| Tecknor Apex 4 $ 136.09 | $ 544.36 | $ 207.37 [ $ 829.48 | $ 142.57 | $ 570.28
mat. 3" x5’ T17-P0035-BL
Mat - Work Safe 7/8" x 3’ x 5’ approx. Grease resistant Teknor Apex 4 $ 114.03 | $ 456.12 | $ 143.25 | $ 573.00 | $ 149.60 | $ 598.40
442-530
Measure Dry: Set of 4; V4 - 1c; Heavy Duty Aluminum Harold Leonard 6 $ 2.79 | $ 16.74 | $ 450 | $ 27.00 | $ 3.96 | $ 23.76
Measure - 1 pint dry, seamless heavy gauge aluminum Halco M-05 1 $ 225 | % 2.25 | $ 7.04 | $ 7.04 | $ 2.77 | $ 2.77
Measure - 1 gt. dry, seamless heavy duty gauge aluminum Halco M-10 1 $ 437 | $ 437 | $ 8.96 | $ 8.96 | $ 4.08 | $ 4.08
Measure - 2 gt. dry, seamless heavy duty gauge aluminum Halco M-20 1 $ 4.78 | $ 4.78 | $ 15.25 | ¢ 1525 | $ 6.15 | $ 6.15
Measure - 4 gt. dry, seamless heavy duty gauge aluminum Halco M-40 1 $ 7.65 | $ 7.65 % 20.58 | $ 20.58 | $ 9.01 | % 9.01
Measure - Liquid, 1 cup Cambro 1 $ 3.09 | $ 3.09 | $ 413 | $ 413 | $ 3.24 | $ 3.24
25MCCW
Measure - Liquid, 1 pint Cambro 1 $ 576 | $ 576 | $ 7.69 | $ 7.69 | $ 6.04 | $ 6.04
50MCCW
Measure - Liquid, 1 qt. Cambro 100 1 $ 6.47 | $ 6.47 | $ 8.63 | $ 8.63 [ $ 6.78 | $ 6.78
MCCW
Measure - Liquid, 2 qt. Cambro 200 1 $ 893 | $ 893 (% 1191 | ¢ 1191 | $ 9.36 | $ 9.36
MCCW
Measure - Liquid, 4 gt. Cambro 400 1 $ 9.69 | $ 9.69 | $ 1292 | $ 12.92 | $ 10.15 [ $ 10.15
MCCW
Measure Spoons: Heavy duty, Stainless Steel, set includes %, 1/2, 1 Harold Leonard 5 $ 0.67 | $ 3.35 | $ 2.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 3.96 | $ 19.80
teaspoons. & 1 tablespoon HL2314
Muffin Pan - Heavy Duty, 2 3/4” diameter, 24 cups Chicago Metallic 1 $ 31.83 | $ 31.83 | $ 45.08 | $ 45.08 | $ 50.44 | $ 50.44
5520
Oven Mitt - Hot, long glove, elbow length protects against burns Duncan KC7X 1 $ 8.04 | $ 8.04 | $ 18.95 | ¢ 18.95 | No Bid No Bid
Pan Holder (Hot pads) - 10”"x10” (rubberized not cloth holders) Duncan KBP 1 $ 12.37 | $ 1237 | $ 17.32 | ¢ 17.32 | No Bid No Bid
Pan Lifter Chef-EZ 1 $ 10.80 | $ 10.80 | $ 7.00 | $ 7.00 | No Bid No Bid
AJ990001




Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty

Pan Bottom, Perforated, Full Size Vollrath 20000 1 $ 21.82 | $ 21.82 | $ 29.99 | $ 29.99 | $ 23.56 | $ 23.56
Pan Bottom, Perforated, Half Size Vollrath 20200 1 $ 12.28 | $ 12.28 | $ 16.88 | $ 16.88 | $ 13.27 | $ 13.27
Pan Bottom, Wire Grate - Full size Vollrath 20028 1 $ 12.51 | $ 12.51 | $ 17.20 | $ 17.20 | $ 13.51 | $ 13.51
Pan Bottom, Wire Grate - Half size Volrath 20228 1 $ 9.76 | $ 9.76 | $ 1342 | $ 1342 | $ 10.54 | $ 10.54
Pans Bun, Heavy Duty Aluminum Full Size PERFORATED Wearever 9002P 60 $ 14.25 | $ 855.00 | $ 19.59 [ $ 1,175.40 | $ 14.16 | $ 849.78
Pans Bun, Heavy Duty Aluminum Half Size PERFORATED Wearever 5303pP 60 $ 12.92 | $ 775.20 | $ 17.77 | $ 1,066.20 | $ 12.84 | $ 770.54
Pans Bun, Heavy Duty Aluminum w/ Sanitary Open Bead, SOLID Full Size Wearever 60 $ 1943 | $ 1,165.80 | $ 26.71 | $ 1,602.60 | $ 19.31 | $ 1,158.54
Pans Bun, Heavy Duty Aluminum w/ Sanitary Open Bead, SOLID Half Size WearNeS\/?;?05303 60 $ 6.60 | $ 396.00 | $ 9.07 | $ 544.20 | $ 6.56 | $ 393.47
Pans, Sauce - 2 gt. Heavy weight Stainless Steel w/ cool handle Vollrath 78421 1 $ 73.29 | $ 73.29 | $ 100.74 | $ 100.74 | $ 72.82 | $ 72.82
Pans, Sauce - 4 1/2 qt. Heavy weight Stainless Steel w/ lid and cool handle |Vollrath 78f141 / 1 $ 100.61 | $ 100.61 | $ 138.29 | $ 138.29 | $ 100.83 | $ 100.83
Pans, Sauce - 10 gt. Heavy weight w/ lids and cool handle VoIIZagtthE('>]8“3_d10 / 1 $ 48.99 | $ 48.99 | $ 67.35 | $ 67.35 | $ 48.68 | $ 48.68
Pans, Steam Table Adaptor Bar - Stainless Steel, 20" Voi:aiioﬁhszo 1 $ 545 | $ 545 | $ 7.50 | $ 7.50 | $ 589 | $ 5.89
Pans - Steam Table Adaptor Bar - Stainless Steel, 12" Vollrath 75012 1 $ 3.57 | $ 3.57 | $ 491 | $ 491 |$ 3.86 | $ 3.86
Pans, Steam Table - Perfforated 12x20x2 1/2, 22 gauge Stainless Steel Vollrath 30023 1 $ 27.09 | $ 27.09 | $ 37.23 | $ 37.23 | $ 29.25 | $ 29.25
Pans, Steam Table - Perforated. 12x20x4, 22 gauge Stainless Steel Vollrath 30043 1 $ 33.87 | $ 33.87 | $ 46.56 | $ 46.56 | $ 36.58 | $ 36.58
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 1/9 size, 4” deep 22 Gauge Stainless Steel Vollrath 30942 1 $ 10.08 | $ 10.08 | $ 13.85 | $ 13.85 | $ 10.89 | $ 10.89
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 1/6 size, 4” deep 22 Gauge Stainless Steel Vollrath 30642 1 $ 8.34 | $ 8.34 | $ 11.47 | $ 1147 | $ 9.01 | $ 9.01
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 1/6 size, 6” deep 22 Gauge Stainless Steel Vollrath 30662 1 $ 11.69 | $ 11.69 | $ 16.07 | $ 16.07 | $ 12.62 | $ 12.62
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 1/4 size, 4” deep 22 Gauge Stainless Steel Vollrath 30442 1 $ 12.28 | $ 12.28 | $ 16.88 | $ 16.88 | $ 13.27 | $ 13.27
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 1/4 size, 6" deep 22 Gauge Vollrath 30462 1 $ 17.46 | $ 17.46 | $ 24.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 18.86 | $ 18.86
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 1/3 size, 4” deep 22 Gauge Stainless Steel Vollrath 30342 1 $ 13.52 | $ 13.52 | $ 18.59 | $ 18.59 | $ 14.60 | $ 14.60
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 1/3 size, 6” deep 22 Gauge Stainless Steel Vollrath 30362 1 $ 1943 | $ 19.43 | $ 26.71 | $ 26.71 | $ 20.99 | $ 20.99
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 12x10x2 1/2, 22 gauge Stainless Vollrath 30222 1 $ 10.17 | $ 10.17 | $ 13.99 | $ 13.99 | $ 10.99 | $ 10.99
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 12x10x4, Stainless Steel 22 gauge, Half Size Vollrath 30242 1 $ 1457 | $ 14.57 | $ 20.03 | $ 20.03 | $ 15.74 | $ 15.74
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 12x10x6 Stainless Steel 22 gauge, Half Size Vollrath 30262 1 $ 20.30 | $ 20.30 | $ 2791 | $ 2791 | $ 2193 | $ 21.93




Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 12x20x2 1/2 Stainless Steel, 22 gauge Vollrath 30022 1 $ 16.36 | $ 16.36 | $ 22,49 | $ 22.49 | $ 17.67 | $ 17.67
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 12x20x4 Stainless Steel, 22 gauge Vollrath 30042 1 $ 2195 | $ 2195 [ $ 30.18 | $ 30.18 | $ 23.71 | $ 23.71
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 12x20x6 Stainless Steel 20 gauge Vollrath 30062 1 $ 32.82 | $ 32.82 | $ 45.11 | $ 45.11 | $ 3544 | $ 35.44
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 6x 20x4 Stainless Steel 22 gauge, Half Long Vollrath 30542 1 $ 22.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 30.24 | $ 30.24 | $ 23.76 | $ 23.76
Pans, Steam Table - Solid 6”x 20”x6"” Stainless Steel 22 gauge, Half Long Vollrath 30562 1 $ 46.84 | $ 46.84 | $ 64.39 | $ 64.39 | $ 50.59 | $ 50.59
Pans, Steam Table Serving Lids - to be Cambro Amber Poly carbon notched s bel $ - $ - $ -
for spoon and withstand up to 300°F. e¢ spec below
Pans, Steam Table lid - 1/9 size, Cambro Amber 90HPC 5 $ 3.65 | $ 18.25 | $ 487 | $ 24.35 | $ 3.83 % 19.14
Pans, Steam Table lid - 1/6 size, Cambro Amber 60HPCHN 5 $ 532 | % 26.60 | $ 7.10 | $ 35.50 | $ 557 | $ 27.87
Pans, Steam Table lid - % size, Cambro Amber 40HPCHN 5 $ 6.65 | $ 33.25 | $ 8.86 | $ 4430 | $ 6.96 | $ 34.82
Pans, Steam Table lid - 1/3 size, Cambro Amber 30HPCHN 5 $ 8.47 | $ 4235 | $ 11.30 | $ 56.50 | $ 8.88 | $ 44.39
Pans, Steam Table lid - %2 size long, Cambro Amber 20LPHPC 5 $ 13.80 | $ 69.00 | $ 18.39 | ¢ 91.95 | $ 14.45 | $ 72.26
Pans, Steam Table lid - -2 size, Cambro Amber 20HPCHN 5 $ 12.23 | $ 61.15 | $ 16.31 | ¢ 81.55 | $ 12.81 | $ 64.06
Pans, Steam Table Lid- Full Size,Cambro Amber 10HPCHN 5 $ 23.13 | $ 115.65 | $ 30.84 | $ 154.20 | $ 24.24 | $ 121.18
Pans, Steam Table Lid - Solid 12x20 FULL size, Stainless Steel, Flat Vollrath 33625 1 $ 20.81 | $ 20.81 | NO BID No Bid $ 2247 | $ 22.47
Pans, Steam Table Lid - Solid 12x10 HALF square size, Stainless Steel, Flat Vollrath 37514 1 $ 10.04 | $ 10.04 | NO BID No Bid $ 10.84 | $ 10.84
Pitchers - 4 qt. Plastic w/ lid, Rubbermaid 1 $ 3.93 | ¢ 3.93 | 3 524 | ¢ 5.24 | $ 4.11 | ¢ 4.11
3063
Pizza Markers - 8 cut Harold Leonard 1 $ 255 | % 255 | $ 110.60 | $ 110.60 | $ 86.90 | $ 86.90
8408 or
Pizza Cutter Dexter P-177A 1 $ 14.65 | $ 14.65 | $ 19.53 | $ 19.53 | $ 1535 [ $ 15.35
Pizza Screen, Heavy Duty 18” Round HS ONLY American Metal 12 $ 4.16 | $ 49.92 | $ 554 | $ 66.48 | $ 4.36 | $ 52.32
Craft 18718
Potato Peeler 3 K Halco 1 $ 1.17 | $ 1.17 | $ 3.78 | $ 3.78 | $ 1.83 | $ 1.83
Pour N Store Unit, 1 quart size, to include Translucent plastic container, Carlisle PS601N 5 $ 4.74 | $ 9.48 | $ 512 | $ 10.24 | $ 501 | $ 10.01
araduated neck. screw on top. spout
Rolling Pin 18” Heavy Duty Solid Poly, one piece design Katchall RP-18 1 $ 10.63 | $ 10.63 | $ 129.14 | $ 129.14 | $ 101.47 | $ 101.47
Safety Goggles Grainger 4401 6 $ 5.50 | $ 33.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 36.00 | No Bid No Bid
Salt/Pepper Dredges with handles Wearever 5062 1 $ 3.57 | $ 3.57 | $ 10.92 | ¢ 10.92 | $ 3.86 | $ 3.86
Scale - Food, %2 0z.. x 5 Ib capacity. Rustless Chassis, Rotating Dial Pelouze YG 5 $ 57.33 | $ 114.66 | $ 76.44 | $ 152.88 | $ 60.06 | $ 120.12
180R




Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty
Scale - Food, 25 |b. x 1 oz. capacity. Rustless Chassis, Rotating Dial Pelouze YG > $ 51.51 | $ 103.02 | $ 76.44 | $ 152.88 | $ 60.06 | $ 120.12
425R
Scale - Digital Portion, 10 Ib x 1/8 oz & 1/4 oz capacity Taylor TE10 > $ 45.36 | $ 90.72 | $ 204.75 | $ 409.50 | $ 47.52 | $ 95.04
Scoop - Clear Poly, 6 oz. Capacity Cambro 1 $ 3.17 | $ 3.17 | $ 422 | $ 422 | $ 3.32 | $ 3.32
SCP6CW
Scoop - Clear Poly, 12 oz. capacity Cambro 1 $ 343 | $ 3.43 | $ 457 | $ 457 | $ 3.59 | $ 3.59
SCP12CW
Scoop - Clear Poly, Utility, 32 oz.. capacity Rubbermaid 6 $ 8.46 | $ 50.76 | $ 11.28 | $ 67.68 | $ 887 | $ 53.20
2884
KatchAll Complete Guardian Caddie w/ clear blue 60z scoop KatchAll 1 $ 23.82 | $ 23.82 | $ 31.76 | $ 31.76 | $ 2495 | $ 24.95
Scoop Caddie for Ice Scoop - Tough HDPE plastic construction with ribbed $ 22.60 | $ 22.60 | $ 30.13 | $ 30.13 | $ 23.67 | $ 23.67
. . K KatchAll SI-2000 1
bottom and hinged lid for ice scoop
Scoop for ice Complete Guardian System clear blue 6 oz. KatchAll 55488 1 $ 6.92 | $ 6.92 | $ 9.22 | $ 9.22 | $ 554 | $ 5.54
Scoops - #6 Stainless Steel Portion, 2/3 c., thumb action Vollrath 47179 > $ 7.15 | $ 14.30 | $ 9.83 | $ 19.66 | $ 7.72 | $ 15.44
Scoops - #8 Stainless Steel Portion, 2 c., squeeze type Vollrath 47150 > $ 7.47 | $ 1494 | $ 10.27 | $ 20.54 | $ 8.07 | $ 16.14
Scoops - #10 Stainless Steel Portion, 3 0z., squeeze type Vollrath 47151 > $ 7.47 | $ 1494 | $ 10.27 | $ 20.54 | $ 8.07 | $ 16.14
Scoops - #12 Stainless Steel Portion, 2 3/4 0z.,squeeze type Vollrath 47152 > $ 7.47 | $ 1494 | $ 10.27 | $ 20.54 | $ 8.07 | $ 16.14
Scoops - #16 Stainless Steel Portion, 2 0z., squeeze type Vollrath 47153 1 $ 7.47 | $ 7.47 | $ 10.27 | $ 10.27 | $ 8.07 | $ 8.07
Scoops - #16 Stainless Steel Portion, 2 0z., Thumb Action Vollrath 47143 1 $ 747 | $ 7.47 | $ 9.83 [ $ 9.83 | % 7.72 | $ 7.72
Scoops - #20 Stainless Steel Portion, 2 %2 0z., squeeze type Vollrath 47154 1 $ 7.47 | $ 7.47 | $ 10.27 | $ 10.27 | $ 8.07 | $ 8.07
Scoops - #24 Stainless Steel Portion, 1 1/2 0z.,squeeze type Vollrath 47155 1 $ 7.47 | $ 7.47 | $ 10.27 | $ 10.27 | $ 8.07 | $ 8.07
Scoops - #30 Stainless Steel Portion, 1 0z., squeeze type Vollrath 47156 1 $ 7.47 | $ 7.47 | $ 10.27 | $ 10.27 | $ 8.07 | $ 8.07
Scoops - #40 Stainless Steel Portion, 1/2 oz., squeeze type Vollrath 47157 1 $ 747 | $ 7.47 | $ 10.27 | $ 10.27 | $ 8.07 | $ 8.07
Scraper - 16", Plastic w/ handle Rubbermaid 12 $ 429 | $ 51.48 | $ 573 1 % 68.76 | $ 450 | $ 53.99
1906
Scraper- White Plastic Flat, no handle Calico 1 $ 0.42 | $ 0.42 | $ 16.25 | $ 16.25 | $ 0.99 | $ 0.99
Sleeve - Heat protector Kevlar SLK16 6 $ 7.14 | $ 42.84 | $ 9.52 | % 57.12 | $ 7.48 [ $ 44.87
Sifter - Heavy Duty Flour Johnson-Rose 1 $ 8.96 | $ 8.96 | $ 12.78 | $ 12.78 | $ 837 [ $ 8.37
Skimmer, Wire mesh 12 3/4" handle, 6 5/16 inch diameter Vollrath 47175 1 $ 11.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 15.12 | $ 15.12 | $ 11.88 | $ 11.88
Spatula, Turner - 2 1/2" x 2", stainless steel, synthetic handle Dexter/Russell 5 $ 7.68 | $ 15.36 | $ 9.36 | $ 18.72 | $ 8.04 | $ 16.09
5240
Spatula, Spreader/Slicer - 3 5/8” x 1 ¥4”, with stainless steel blade and NSF | Dexter/Russell > $ 6.28 | $ 12.56 | $ 7.84 | $ 15.68 | $ 6.58 | $ 13.17
svnthetic handle S173




Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty
Spatula, Turner — 3” x 4”, stainless steel blade, synthetic handle Dexter/Russell 5 $ 14.86 | $ 29.72 | $ 19.81 | $ 39.62 | $ 15.57 | $ 31.14
52864
Spatula{ Turner - _3” X 6” square edge hamburger turner, stainless steel Dexter P94855 > $ 8.72 | $ 17.44 | $ 11.62 | $ 23.24 | $ 9.13 | $ 18.27
blade with svnthetic handle
Spatula, Icing - 8" x 1 %", Stainless Steel blade with NSF synthetic handle Dexter 52848 > $ 9.99 | $ 19.98 | $ 13.32 | $ 26.64 | $ 10.47 | $ 20.94
Spoodle - 2 oz. perforated portion Cont. Silite 6 $ 488 | $ 29.28 | $ 6.56 | $ 39.36 | $ 9.01 | $ 54.05
4361
Spoodle - 2 oz. solid portion with grip and serve handle Vollrath 61157 6 $ 7.29 | $ 43.74 | $ 10.02 | $ 60.12 | $ 787 | $ 47.22
Spoodle - 3 oz. perforated portion Cont. Silite 6 $ 4.66 | $ 27.96 | $ 6.27 | $ 37.62 | $ 9.01 | $ 54.05
4371
Spoodle - 3 oz. solid portion Cont. Silite 6 $ 4.66 | $ 27.96 | $ 6.27 | $ 37.62 | $ 9.01 | $ 54.05
4370
Spoodle - 4 oz. perforated portion Cont. Silite 6 $ 492 | $ 29.52 | $ 6.63 | $ 39.78 | $ 9.01 | $ 54.05
4381
Spoodle - 4 oz. solid portion Cont. Silite 6 $ 492 | $ 29.52 | $ 6.63 | $ 39.78 | $ 9.01 | $ 54.05
4380
Spoodle - 6 oz. perforated portion Cont. Silite4391 6 $ 5.60 | $ 33.60 | $ 753 | $ 45.18 | $ 592 | $ 35.52
Spoodle - 6 oz. solid portion Vollrath 61177 6 $ 7.70 | $ 46.20 | $ 10.02 | $ 60.12 | $ 832 | $ 49.90
Spoodle - 8 oz. solid portion with grip and serve handle Vollrath 61182 6 $ 7.70 | $ 46.20 | $ 10.58 | $ 63.48 | $ 832 | $ 49.90
Spoons - Stainless Steel Perforated Serving w/ Grip “N Serve Plastic Handles Vollrath 61180 1 $ 7.70 | $ 7.70 | $ 10.58 | $ 10.58 | $ 832 (% 8.32
Squeegee - Floor, 18” with wood tapered handle Rubbermaid > $ 11.25 | $ 22.50 | $ 13.38 | $ 26.76 | $ 10.52 | $ 21.04
6540 w/ 6362
Squeegee, 18” Replacement Blades ONLY Rubbermaid 1 $ 10.17 | $ 10.17 | $ 13.57 | $ 13.57 | $ 10.66 | $ 10.66
6546
Stool - Two step, Metal frame on casters, Grid Step Rubbermaid 1 $ 78.06 | $ 78.06 | $ 95.37 | $ 95.37 | $ 7493 | $ 74.93
2523
Storage Container 6 qt. w/ Lid, pocket style handles, Carb-x construction Cambro 1 $ 9.08 | $ 9.08 | $ 12.10 | $ 12.10 | $ 9.51 | $ 9.51
6SFSCW-SFC6
Storage Container - 8qt. w/ Lid, pocket style handles, Carb-x construction Cambro 1 $ 10.33 | $ 10.33 | $ 13.77 | $ 13.77 | $ 10.83 | $ 10.83
8SFSCW-SFC6
Storage Container - 12 gt. w/ Lid, pocket style handles, Carb-x construction 1;2';';’5\;_ 6 $ 14.01 | $ 84.06 | $ 18.69 | $ 112.14 | $ 14.68 | $ 88.08
[al =/ak e}
Storage Container - 12 gt. LID ONLY for CAMBRO 12SFCW-SFC12 CAMBRO 6 $ 2.76 | $ 16.56 | $ 3.69 | $ 22.14 | $ 290 | $ 17.37
12SFCW-SFC12
Storage Container - Food, Large 13 qt.; 26”"x18"x9", Clear Carb-x Cambro 1 $ 30.12 | $ 30.12 | $ 40.16 | $ 40.16 | $ 31.56 | $ 31.56
construction 18269CW
Storage Container Lid ONLY - for 26” x 18” Food Storage Containers, Clear Cambro 1 $ 11.99 | $ 11.99 | $ 1598 | $ 1598 | $ 12.56 | $ 12.56
Carb-x construction 1826CCW
Storage Container Drain Shelf - for 26”"x18" Cambro 1 $ 9.86 | $ 9.86 | $ 13.15 | $ 13.15 | $ 10.33 | $ 10.33
1826CBDSP
Strainers, China Cap Style - 5 1/2 gt. Capacity Lincoln WE 1 $ 53.85 | $ 53.85 | $ 74.03 | $ 74.03 | $ 58.16 58.16
4700
Strainer, The Panhandler Kitchenwares 1 N/A N/A $ 70.00 | $ 70.00 | No Bid No Bid
280-1334
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Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty
Stock Pot,12 gt. w/ cover tri-ply, 18-8 type 304 stainless steel, welded Vollrath 5 $ 11494 | $ 229.88 | $ 158.01 | $ 316.02 | $ 114.21 | $ 228.42
handles. liguid measure marks on inside of pot 77580477572
Stock Pot,16 gt. w/ cover tri-ply, 18-8 type 304 stainless steel, welded Vollrath 5 $ 162.61 | $ 325.22 | $ 223.52 | $ 447.04 | $ 161.58 | $ 323.16
handles. liguid measure marks on inside of pot 77600+77662
Sub Roll Baking Form - Silform nonstick bread form, Heat resistant, Reusable [Malfer 60-02955 1 $ 33.60 | $ 33.60 | $ 44.80 | $ 44.80 | $ 35.20 | $ 35.20
up to 3000 times. Five rolls per form Silform sub roll
Thermometer, Digital, Waterproof Taylor 9848 30 $ 15.59 | $ 467.70 | $ 20.79 | $ 623.70 | $ 16.34 | $ 490.05
EFDA
Thermometer - Cold/Hot Food Pocket Digital, NSF, -58 to 300 degrees F Comark PDT 30 $ 18.11 | $ 543.30 | $ 21.74 | $ 652.20 | $ 22.77 | $ 683.10
300
Thermometer, Sanitary Digital Probe Wipes (10 boxes to a case) Cooper 9150 30 $ 77.29 | $ 2,318.70 | $ 15.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 80.97 | $ 2,429.09
Thermometer - Dry Food Storage Cooper 264 30 $ 27.04 | $ 811.20 | $ 542 | $ 162.60 | $ 28.33 | $ 849.75
Thermometer, Dish Machine:MINLON PLASTIC ARMOR CASE 0-220 DEGREES | TAYLOR 21462- 37 $ 16.07 | $ 594.59 | $ 21.42 | $ 792.54 | 16.83 | $ 622.71
Thermometer - Freezer/Refrigerator, NSF, -20 to 80 degrees F Comark RFT2A 10 $ 294 | $ 29.40 | $ 3.53 | % 35.30 | $ 3.70 | $ 36.96
THERMOMETER, PROOFING/HOLDING CABINET COOPER /ATKINS 10 $ 4.06 | $ 40.60 | $ 542 | $ 54.20 | $ 4.26 | $ 42.55
26HP-01-1

Thermometer - Oven, Stainless Steel Case, NSF, 200 to 500°F Comark DOT2A 1 $ 2.94 | % 2.94 ($ 3.53 | % 353 (3% 3.70 | $ 3.70
Timer - 60 Minute mechanical, Long ring, manual shut off Cooper MT60 3 $ 9.63 | $ 28.89 | $ 12.84 | $ 38.52 | $ 10.09 | $ 30.26
Tomato Slicer blade assembly only for model 15103 Vollrath 15113 1 $ 50.19 | $ 50.19 | $ 68.99 | $ 68.99 | $ 54.20 | $ 54.20
Tomato Slicer blade assembly only for model NEMCO 55600 466-2 1 $ 2441 | $ 24.41 | $ 70.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 25.58 | $ 25.58
TOMATO SLICER BLADE ASSEMBLY ONLY FOR LINCOLN 0644N 654 1 $ 29.06 | $ 29.06 | $ 39.94 | $ 39.94 | $ 31.38 | $ 31.38
Tomato Slicer Vollrath 15103 1 $ 31991 | $ 319.91 | $ 439.74 | $ 439.74 | $ 34551 | $ 345.51
Tongs - 11 - 13” Pasta Fork with oval perforated bowl head w/ finger $ 459 | $ 4.59 | $ 6.12 | $ 6.12 | $ 481 | $ 4.81

projections to hold spaghetti

Tablecaft 2068
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Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
Product Description Manufacturer/
Model Qty
Tongs, Lift and Grip - 10” stainless steel tong with scalloped edges and Volirath 47043 1 $ 4.49 | $ 4.49 | $ 8.63 [ $ 8.63 | $ 431 | $ 4.31
flattened nose to act like a spatula
Tongs, Pom, 6” BLACK break resistant polycarbonate, NSF (Self-Serve Carlilse 480603 1 $ 1.28 | $ 1.28 | $ 1.71 | $ 1.71 | $ 1.34 | $ 1.34
Condiments
Tongs, Pom, 6” CLEAR break resistant polycarbonate, NSF (Self-Serve Carlisle 4206 5 $ 1.28 | $ 6.40 | $ 1.71 | $ 8.55 | $ 1.34 | $ 6.71
Condiments (480603)
Tongs, Spaghetti - 8" Stainless Steel Vollrath 47105 1 $ 289 | $ 2.89 | $ 397 | $ 3.97 | $ 3.12 | $ 3.12
Tongs, Carly Salad 9" BLACK break resist. Polycarb. NSF (for Self-Serve Carlisle 460603 1 $ 1.28 | $ 1.28 | $ 1.71 | $ 1.71 | $ 1.34 | $ 1.34
Condiments)
Tongs, Utility - 9 1/2" Heavy gage stainless steel, scalloped edges with Vollrath 47309 10 $ 238 | $ 23.80 | $ 3.28 | $ 32.80 | $ 257 | $ 25.74
rounded nose
Trash Containers -. Continental/Rubbermaid Huskee Brute 44 gal Rubbermaid 1 $ 51.72 | $ 51.72 | $ 65.60 | $ 65.60 | $ 51.55 | $ 51.55
4444
Trash Containers - Continental/Rubbermaid Huskee Brute 32 gal Rubbermaid 1 $ 31.84 | $ 31.84 | $ 42.45 | $ 4245 | $ 33.35 | $ 33.35
R3200BK
Trash Can Twist on Dolly Rubbermaid Rubbermaid 1 $ 82.47 | $ 82.47 | $ 66.51 | $ 66.51 | $ 52.26 | $ 52.26
3255
Trays - PMC Dallasware Compartment Serving, 14 1/2” x 10” Color to be Carlisle 43988 - 50 94.68 | ¢ 4,734.00 | $ 11491 | $ 5,745.50 | $ 134.40 | $ 6,720.00
determined when ordered PER DOZEN
Trays Display White 12 X 30 (1/2 long bun length) Cambro 1230MT 50 $ 13.96 | $ 698.00 | $ 18.62 | $ 931.00 | $ 14.63 [ $ 731.36
Tray, Display- Full Bun Pan Size. Black, Blue, Red, Green or Yellow. State Cambro 1826MT 50 $ 1571 | $ 785.50 | $ 2095 | $ 1,047.50 | $ 16.46 | $ 822.94
quantity by color. PRIMARY COLORS (Each)
Tray, Display- 2 Bun Pan Size, Black, Blue, Red, Green or Yellow. State Cambro 1318MT 50 $ 9.85 | $ 492.50 | $ 13.14 | $ 657.00 | $ 10.32 | $ 516.04
quantity by color. PRIMARY COLORS (Each)
Wet Floor Sign. Rubbermaid 1 $ 13.66 | $ 13.66 | $ 16.62 | $ 16.62 | $ 13.06 | $ 13.06
6112-77
Whip, Wire - 16" Stainless Steel French Vollrath 47016 1 $ 8.07 | $ 8.07 | $ 11.09 | $ 11.09 | $ 9.01 |3 9.01
Dish Towels (Dozen) San Jamar 700 50 $ 9.45 | $ 472.50 | $ 8.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 9.90 | % 494.88
BRT32
Pot Holders (Dozen) s $ 38.90 | $ 1,945.00 | $ 52.20 | $ 2,610.00 | $ 40.76 | $ 2,037.82
an Jamar 50
823TPH
Grand Total Cost $40,908.49 $53,420.81 $42,908.32
Lead Time For Delivery After Receipt of Order 4-6 Weeks 3-6 Weeks 30 Days

Notes

Awarded Contract To Lowest
Bidder

No Bid 23 Items
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